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An Act 

To designate a segment of the Kings River in California as a wild and scenic river, 
and for other purposes. 

Be it enacted by the Senate and House of Representatives of the 
United States of America in Congress assembled, 
SECTION 1. DESIGNATION OF KINGS RIVER. 

(a) DESIGNATION.-Section 3(a) of the Wild and Scenic Rivers Act 
(16 U.S.C. 1274(a)) is amended by adding the following new para­
graph at the end: 

"(62) KINGS, CALIFORNIA.-The Middle Fork of the Kings River 
from its headwaters at Lake Helen between Muir Pass and Black 
Giant Mountain to its confluence with the main stem; the South 
Fork, Kings River from its headwaters at Lake 11599 to its con­
fluence with the main stem; and the main stem of the Kings River 
from the confluence of the Middle Fork and the South Fork to the 
point at elevation 1,595 feet above mean sea level. The segments 
within the Kings Canyon National Park shall be administered by 
the Secretary of the Interior. The remaining segments shall be 
administered by the Secretary of Agriculture. After consultation 
with State and local governments and the interested public and 
within one year after the enactment of this paragraph, the respec­
tive Secretaries shall take such action as is required under subsec­
tion (b) of this section. In the case of the segments of the river 
administered by the Secretary of the Interior, the requirements of 
subsection (b) shall he fulfilled through appropriate revisions to the 
general management plan for Kings Canyon National Park, and the 
boundaries, classification, and development plans for such segments 
need not be published in the Federal Register. Such revisions to the 
general management plan for the park shall assure that no develop­
ment or use of park lands shall be undertaken that is inconsistent 
with the designation of the river under this paragraph. For the 
purposes of the segments designated by this paragraph, there are 
authorized to be appropriated such sums as may be necessary, but 
not to exceed $250,000, to the Secretary of Agriculture for develop­
ment and land acquisition.". 

(b) RENUMBERING.-Section 3(a) of the Wild and Scenic Rivers Act 
(16 U.S.C. 1274(a)) is amended by redesignating the paragraphs 
relating to the Cache La Poudre River, the Saline Bayou, Black 
Creek, the Klickitat, and the White Salmon as paragraphs (57) 
through (61), respectively. 
SEC. 2. SPECIAL MANAGEMENT AREA. 

(a) EsTABLISHMENT.-In order to provide for public outdoor recre­
ation use and enjoyment of certain areas within the Sierra National 
Forest and the Sequoia National Forest, to protect those areas' 
natural, archaeological, and scenic resources, and to provide for 
appropriate fish and wildlife management of those areas, there is 
hereby established the Kings River Special Management Area 
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